



**Glenview Park District
Regular Park Board Meeting
July 23, 2009**

HIGHLIGHTS

The Board of Park Commissioners...

- Approved the June 25, 2009, FY2009-2010 Budget and Appropriations Ordinance Public Hearing minutes.
- Approved the June 25, 2009 Regular Board Meeting minutes.
- Approved Payroll and Accounts Payable for the month of June, 2009 in the amount of \$2,126,972.89.
- Approved a Staff recommendation to accept the bid for the Installation of Playground Equipment at Ladendorf, Countryside, Rugen, Manor and Central Tot Lot from the lowest qualified bidder Elanar Construction Co., of Glenview, IL, in the amount of \$271,736.75—On Thursday, July 16, 2009, seven bids were received for the installation of playground equipment at these parks. One of the bidders did not meet the bid specifications, and was disqualified. The playground equipment was approved separately at the June 25, 2009 Board meeting. A summary of the qualifying bids follows:

BIDDER:	ELANAR	GREEN-UP	BLUE MEL'S	PEDERSEN	FUERTE	KENNETH CO.
	Glenview, IL	Plainfield, IL	Greenfield, WI	Deerfield, IL	Plainfield, IL	Bolingbrook IL
Location						
Ladendorf	66,748	78,419	76,547	92,831.25	82,382.50	89,632
Countryside	60,557	71,027.49	74,848	68,674	83,568	84,382
Rugen	52,027.75	60,875.17	62,267.50	67,497	69,977.50	73,711
Manor	52,094	56,895.20	59,400	56,325	65,095	64,097
Central Tot	40,310	44,000.10	45,075	47,930	52,191	56,803
Total	\$271,736.75	\$311,216.96	\$318,137.50	\$333,257.25	\$353,214	\$368,625

- Approved a Staff recommendation to accept the base bids for Paving Projects in Flick, Countryside, Rugen, Sleepy Hollow, Ladendorf, Crowley, and Hawthorn Glen Parks to the low bidder, A Lamp Concrete Contractors of Schaumburg, IL, in the amount of \$189,770.25 —Bids were received on Thursday, July 16, for various paving projects. The scope of work is primarily the replacement of deteriorated park walks with new concrete sidewalks at six park locations and a small amount of parking lot curb work at Hawthorn Glen Park. Alternate bids for pervious concrete in place of standard concrete at five of the park sites were also requested. If the combined Finance, Environmental/Natural Resources and Buildings, Grounds and Park Services Committee recommends the use of the *pervious concrete at their August 24 meeting, change orders for the projects will be issued. A summary of the qualifying bids follows:

BIDDER	A. LAMP	LANDMARK	MARTAM	MERIDEAN	JACOBS & SON
	Schaumburg, IL	Huntley, IL	Elgin, IL	Lake Bluff, IL	Rolling Meadows, IL
Location					
Flick Park	28,110.00	34,094.75	40,800.00	47,595.00	63,501.00
Countryside walkway	37,688.75	55,236.50	82,974.00	67,551.75	91,928.00
Alternate Countryside porous concrete	129,315.00	121,826.50	130,954.00	228,782.25	No Bid
Rugen walkway	49,593.75	71,886.50	104,070.00	90,418.75	122,691.00
Alternate Rugen porous concrete	163,375.00	168,536.50	163,570.00	224,431.30	No Bid
Sleepy Hollow walkway	10,975.00	21,755.00	32,500.00	23,125.00	35,958.00
*Alternate Sleepy Hollow porous	37,700.00	43,900.00	46,500.00	73,700.00	No Bid
Ladendorf walkway	9,583.75	18,312.00	18,504.00	16,604.75	23,542.00
*Alternate Ladendorf porous	31,555.00	37,108.00	29,350.00	54,933.25	No Bid
Crawley walkway	49,936.25	74,740.25	105,326.00	90,123.25	122,337.00
Alternate Crowley porous	170,835.00	173,564.25	161,550.00	297,462.80	No Bid
Hawthorne Glen curbing	3,882.75	9,197.00	5,362.00	5,365.00	9,555.00
Base Bid Totals	\$189,770.25	\$285,222.00	\$389,536.00	\$340,783.50	\$469,512.00
Recommended Award Items	\$189,770.25				

* Director Balling thanked Bob Quill, Kathleen McInnis, the Fourth of July Committee and Park District staff for all their planning and efforts in making the Fourth of July a huge success. He said he has received many compliments from residents on the parade, fireworks and accompanying music. He noted the weather cooperated beautifully just in time for the fireworks display. He also thanked the Commissioners who attended and for all their support.

The next regular Park Board meeting will be held at 7:00 p.m., Thursday, August 27, 2009. The meeting will be held at Park Center, 2400 Chestnut, Glenview IL. The public is welcome. If special needs are required in order to attend this meeting, please call the Park District Office, 847-657-3215.